COMMISSION ACTION MATRIX
STRUCTURAL DESIGN / LATERAL FORCES (SDLF) CODE ADVISORY COMMITTEE – JULY 16-17, 2024
[bookmark: _Hlk166499242]2025 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE, TITLE 24, PART 2, 2024 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE (IBC)
AGENCY: DIVISION OF THE STATE ARCHITECT, DSA-SS 05/24
LEGEND:
CAC Actions: Approve, Disapprove, Approve as Amended, Further Study Required
Agency Responses: Accept, Disagree, Withdraw
CBSC Actions: Approve, Disapprove, Approve as Amended, Further Study Required
[bookmark: _Hlk51752204]Matrix Paper Color (for commission action only): GREEN = uncontested items, YELLOW = challenged items, SALMON = withdrawn, no action required
[bookmark: _Hlk51751202]If using assistive technology, please adjust your settings to recognize underline, strikeout, italic and ellipsis.
· Model Code or reference standard language language appears upright
· Existing California amendments appear in italic
· Amended model code or reference standard language, or new California amendments appear underlined & italic
· Reference standard language included in new California amendments appears underlined & upright if unchanged 
· Repealed model code or reference standard language appears upright and in strikeout
· Repealed California amendments appear in italic and strikeout
· Ellipses (…) indicate existing text remains unchanged
ITEM 1
Chapter 1, SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION
Adopt Chapter 1 of 2024 IBC and bring forward existing California amendments from the 2022 CBC with modification to sections listed below.
	DSA-SS 05-24
ITEM 1
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	1-1
	1.9.2.1.1 Applicable administrative standards.
	
	
	
	Editorial change.
	

	1-2
	1.9.2.1.3 Identification of amendments.
	
	
	
	Editorial change.
	

	1-3
	1.9.2.1.4 Reference to other chapters.
	
	
	
	Updating reference to California Building Code.
	

	1-4
	1.9.2.2.1 Applicable administrative standards.
	
	
	
	Editorial change
	

	1-5
	1.9.2.2.3 Identification of amendments.
	
	
	
	Revision to clarify “identification of amendments” and added banner for adopting agency.
	

	1-6
	1.9.2.2.4 Reference to other chapters.
	
	
	
	Updating reference to California Building Code.
	

	1-7
	104.2.3 Alternative materials, …
	
	
	
	Add amendment to prohibit the use of exception.
	

	1-8
	104.2.3.3 Compliance  with  code  intent.
	
	
	
	Amendments relocated.
	



ITEM 2
Chapter 2, DEFINITIONS
Adopt Chapter 2 of 2024 IBC and bring forward existing California amendments from the 2022 CBC with modification to sections listed below.
	DSA-SS 05-24
ITEM 2
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	2-1
	NEXT GENERATION ATTENUATION WEST 2
	
	
	
	Repeal definition as it is no longer used in the code.

	

	2-2
	PERIODIC SPECIAL INSPECTION.
	
	
	
	Repeal definition as it is now provided as a subitem to “SPECIAL INSPECTION”.
	

	2-3
	PUBLIC-OCCUPANCY TEMPORARY STRUCTURE.
	
	
	
	Add amendment to clarify that this does not apply to school buildings.
	

	2-4
	SPECIAL INSPECTION.
	
	
	
	Revise amendment. 
	



ITEM 3
Chapters 3-10 and 12
Adopt Chapters 3-10 and 12 of 2024 IBC without amendment.
	DSA-SS 05-24
ITEM 3
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	3-1
	Chapters 3-10, 12
	
	
	
	Adopt Chapters 3-10 and 12 of 2024 IBC without amendment.
	



ITEM 4
Chapter 14, EXTERIOR WALLS
Adopt Chapter 14 of 2024 IBC and bring forward existing California amendments from the 2022 CBC with modification to sections listed below.
	DSA-SS 05-24
ITEM 4
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	4-1
	[bookmark: _Hlk159160322]1404.1.2 1404.1.1 Additional requirements.
	
	
	
	Amendment renumbered and pointers revised.
	

	4-2
	1413 1410 
	
	
	
	Section and all the subsections renumbered.
	

	4-3
	1413.2 1410.2 Adhered veneer.
	
	
	
	Renumbered and editorial modifications.
	

	4-4
	1413.2.1 1410.2.1 Bond strength and tests.
	
	
	
	Amendment renumbered. Language revised. No material changes.
	

	4-5
	1413.2.2 TMS 402 Section 13.3.2.2.
	
	
	
	New section added to revise TMS 402.
	



ITEM 5
Chapter 15, ROOF ASSEMBLIES AND ROOFTOP STRUCTURES
Adopt Chapter 15 of 2024 IBC and bring forward existing California amendments from the 2022 CBC with modification to sections listed below.
	DSA-SS 05-24
ITEM 5
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	5-1
	1511.10 1511.9 Photovoltaic (PV) panel systems.
	
	
	
	Renumbered. Remove unnecessary duplications and clarify requirements for manufacturer’s instructions.
	

	5-2
	1511.10.1 1511.9.1 Design Installation.
	
	
	
	Section renumbered. Editorial changes to clarify requirements for the design of PV panel systems.
	



ITEM 6
Chapter 16, STRUCTURAL DESIGN
Adopt Chapter 16 of 2024 IBC and bring forward existing California amendments from the 2022 CBC with modification to sections listed below.
	DSA-SS 05-24
ITEM 6
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	6-1
	1601.1.2
	
	
	
	Editorial changes.
	

	6-2
	1601.1.3
	
	
	
	Added section.
	

	6-3
	1601.1.4 1601.1.3
	
	
	
	Renumbered section.
	

	6-4
	1601.1.5 1601.1.4
	
	
	
	Renumbered section and editorial amendment.
	

	6-5
	1617.2.1.4 Analysis.
	
	
	
	Repeal existing amendment. 
	

	6-6
	1617.2.2 1617.2.1.3 Risk Category ...
	
	
	
	Relocated amendment.
	

	6-7
	1617.2.3 1617.2.2 Structural walls.
	
	
	
	Renumbered section.
	

	6-8
	1617.2.4 Photovoltaic (PV) panel systems.
	
	
	
	New amendment language.
	

	6-9
	1617.3.1 Stability.
	
	
	
	Amendment language removed.
	

	6-10
	1617.3.3.1 ICC 300, Section 303.5.2. 
1617.3.3.1 1617.3.3.2
	
	
	
	Delete existing amendment. Renumber section. Revise language.
	

	6-11
	1617.5.1.4 Item 37 38 
1617.5.1.5 Item 38 39
	
	
	
	Items renumbered.
	

	6-12
	1617.5.3 Seating for assembly uses.
	
	
	
	Pointers revised.
	

	6-13
	1617.8 Soil loads.
	
	
	
	New section added.
	

	6-14
	1617.8.1 Lateral pressures.
	
	
	
	New section added.
	

	6-15
	1617.9 Flood loads.
	
	
	
	New section added.
	

	6-16
	1617.9.1 1617.8 
	
	
	
	Renumbered amendment.
	

	6-17
	1617.10 1617.9 Earthquake loads.
	
	
	
	Renumbered amendment.
	

	6-18
	1617.9.1 & 1617.9.2
	
	
	
	Repeal existing amendments.
	

	6-19
	1617.9.3 & 1617.9.4
	
	
	
	Repeal existing amendments.
	

	6-20
	1617.10.1 1617.9.5 Determination of seismic design category.
	
	
	
	Relocated amendment. Revise language. 
	

	6-21
	1617.9.5.1
	
	
	
	Repeal existing amendments.
	

	6-22
	1617.10.2 1617.9.5.2
	
	
	
	Renumbered and pointer revised.
	

	6-23
	1617.10.3 1617.9.6
	
	
	
	Renumbered.
	

	6-24
	1617.11 1617.10 Tsunami loads.
	
	
	
	Renumbered.
	

	6-25
	1617.12 1617.11 Modifications to ASCE 7.
	
	
	
	Renumbered and pointer revised.
	

	6-26
	1617.12.1 1617.11.1
	
	
	
	Renumbered and language revised.
	

	6-27
	1617.11.2 ASCE 7, Section 11.4.
	
	
	
	Amendment deleted.
	

	6-28
	1617.12.2 1617.11.3
	
	
	
	Items renumbered.
	

	6-29
	1617.11.4 with subsections
	
	
	
	Amendments deleted.
	

	6-30
	[bookmark: _Hlk165458274]1617.11.5, 1617.11.11, 1617.11.12, 1617.11.22 and 1617.11.23
	
	
	
	Reserved sections deleted.
	

	6-31
	1617.12.3 1617.11.6
1617.12.4 1617.11.7
1617.12.5 1617.11.8
	
	
	
	Renumbered sections.
	

	6-32
	1617.12.6 1617.11.9 ASCE 7, Section 12.3.3.1.
	
	
	
	Section is revised to align with ASCE 7-22.
	

	6-33
	1617.12.7 1617.11.10
	
	
	
	Item renumbered.
	

	6-34
	1617.12.8 ASCE 7, Section 12.10.2.1.
	
	
	
	Add new section.
	

	6-35
	1617.12.9 1617.11.13
	
	
	
	Renumbered amendment.
	

	6-36
	1617.12.10 ASCE 7, Section 12.13.5.2.
	
	
	
	Add new section.
	

	6-37
	1617.12.11 1617.11.14
	
	
	
	Amendment renumbered. Language revised.
	

	6-38
	1617.12.12 1617.11.15 ASCE 7, Section 13.1.4.
	
	
	
	Amendment renumbered. Language revised.
	

	6-39
	1617.12.13 1617.11.16
1617.12.14 1617.11.17
1617.12.15 1617.11.18
	
	
	
	Renumbered sections.
	

	6-40
	1617.12.16 1617.11.19 ASCE 7, Section 13.6.7.3. 
	
	
	
	Amendment renumbered. Language revised.
	

	6-41
	1617.12.17 1617.11.20
1617.12.18 1617.11.21
1617.12.19 1617.11.22
	
	
	
	Renumbered sections.
	



ITEM 7
Chapter 16A, STRUCTURAL DESIGN
Adopt Chapter 16 of 2024 IBC as Chapter 16A of 2025 CBC and bring forward existing California amendments from the 2022 CBC with modification to sections listed below.
	DSA-SS 05-24
ITEM 7
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	7-1
	1604A.4 Analysis.
	
	
	
	Repeal amendment.
	

	7-2
	1604A.5.2 Photovoltaic (PV) panel systems.
	
	
	
	New amendment language.
	

	7-3
	1605A.1.1 Stability.
	
	
	
	Repeal amendment.
	

	7-4
	1605A.3.1 ICC 300, Section 303.5.2.
1605A.3.1 1605A.3.2
	
	
	
	Delete existing amendment. Renumber section. Revise language. 
	

	7-5
	1607A.1 General.
	
	
	
	Delete entire amendment.
	

	7-6
	Table 1607A.1
	
	
	
	Errata. Item renumbered.
	

	7-7
	1607A.14.4 1607A.14.5
	
	
	
	Section renumbered.
	

	7-8
	1607A.18 Seating for assembly uses.
	
	
	
	Model section renumbered in 2024 IBC and amendment retain withing the renumbered section.
	

	7-9
	1610A.1 Lateral pressures.
	
	
	
	Section language revised. Added note.
	

	7-10
	1613A.1 Scope.
	
	
	
	Revise language. Exception is deleted. 
	

	7-11
	1613A.2 Determination of seismic design category.
	
	
	
	Relocated language from 1613A.2.5 to this section.
	

	7-12
	1613A.2.5 Determination of seismic design category and 1613A.2.5.1
	
	
	
	Model code deleted in 2024 IBC. Amendments in deleted sections relocated.
	

	7-13
	1613A.3 Simplified design procedure.
1613A.4 Ballasted photovoltaic panel systems.
	
	
	
	Section renumbered in 2024 IBC. No Change in existing amendment.
	

	7-14
	1617A.1 General.
	
	
	
	Revised pointer.
	

	7-15
	1617A.1.1 ASCE 7, Section 1.3.
	
	
	
	Revised language to align with ASCE 7 Section 31.6.
	

	7-16
	1617A.1.3 Reserved. ASCE 7, Section 11.4.
	
	
	
	Amendment repealed.
	

	7-17
	1617A.1.4 ASCE 7, Table 12.2-1.
	
	
	
	Items renumbered.
	

	7-18
	1617A.1.5 Reserved. ASCE 7, Section 12.2.3, 12.2.3.1 and 12.2.3.2.
	
	
	
	Amendments in Section 1617A.1.5 and its subsections repealed.
	

	7-19
	1617A.1.10 ASCE 7, Section 12.3.3.1.
	
	
	
	Section is revised to align with ASCE 7-22.
	

	7-20
	1617A.1.11
	
	
	
	Item renumbered.
	

	7-21
	1617A.1.12 Reserved. ASCE 7, Section 12.10.2.1.
	
	
	
	New amendment to clarify the exception.
	

	7-22
	1617A.1.13 Reserved. ASCE 7, Section 12.13.5.2.
	
	
	
	Add new amendment.
	

	7-23
	1617A.1.16
	
	
	
	Revised language for clarification.
	

	7-24
	1617A.1.18 ASCE 7, Section 13.1.4.
	
	
	
	Revised language.
	

	7-25
	1617A.1.19 ASCE 7, Section 13.4
	
	
	
	Revise amendment to coordinate with updated ASCE 7.
	

	7-26
	1617A.1.23 ASCE 7, Section 13.6.2.1 and ASCE 7, Tables 13.5-1 and 13.6-1.
	
	
	
	Repeal amendments.
	

	7-27
	1617A.1.26
	
	
	
	Reference to Rp value deleted. Other editorial changes.
	

	7-28
	[bookmark: _Hlk164233378]1617A.1.37 Reserved. ASCE 7, Section 18.3. 1617A.1.38
	
	
	
	Section renumbered.
	



ITEM 8
Chapter 17A, SPECIAL INSPECTIONS AND TESTS
Adopt Chapter 17 of 2024 IBC as Chapter 17A of 2025 CBC and bring forward existing California amendments from the 2022 CBC with modification to sections listed below.
	DSA-SS 05-24
ITEM 8
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	8-1
	1701A.4
	
	
	
	Revised references.
	

	8-2
	1704A.2.4 Report requirement.
	
	
	
	Editorial changes to align with revised model code language.
	

	8-3
	1704A.3 Statement of special inspections.
	
	
	
	Add amendment to clarify that model code exception does not apply.
	

	8-4
	1704A.4 Contractor responsibility.
	
	
	
	Change amendment requiring statement of responsibilities on some projects.
	

	8-5
	1704A.5 Submittals to the building official.
	
	
	
	Adjusted language to clarify references and align with model code numbering.
	

	8-6
	1705A.2.1 Structural steel.
	
	
	
	Removed reference to national standards and added clarifications of standards used in the state of California.
	

	8-7
	Table 1705A.2.1
	
	
	
	Adding DSA banner. Other minor editorial changes.
	

	8-8
	1705A.2.2 Structural stainless steel.
	
	
	
	Adding amendments to address new model code section for structural stainless steel.
	

	8-9
	1705A.2.3 Cold-formed steel deck.
	
	
	
	Delete previous amendment language. Propose deletion of model code language. Propose new amendments.
	

	8-10
	1705A.2.4.1 1705A.2.3.1 
1705A.2.5.1 1705A.2.4.1
	
	
	
	Renumbered sections with editorial amendments in Section 1705A.2.5.1.
	

	8-11
	[bookmark: _Hlk151554092]1705A.2.7 1705A.2.5
1705A.2.8 1705A.2.6
	
	
	
	Renumbered sections with editorial amendments.
	

	8-12
	1705A.2.9 Special inspection and tests of cold-formed steel light-frame construction.
	
	
	
	New section added.
	

	8-13
	Table 1705A.3 
	
	
	
	Various proposed amendments for renumbering, adjusting references and editorial changes.
	

	8-14
	1705A.3.1
	
	
	
	Revised pointer.
	

	8-15
	1705A.3.3 Batch plant inspection.
	
	
	
	Adding previously lacking minimum qualifications for batch plant inspectors.
	

	8-16
	1705A.3.3.1
	
	
	
	Reformatting listing for the first two items.
	

	8-17
	1705A.3.3.2 Batch plant inspection not required.
	
	
	
	Simplifying code language. Added item to clarify exemption for deep foundations.
	

	8-18
	1705A.4 Masonry construction.
	
	
	
	Provide a reference pointer to 1705A.3.3.
	

	8-19
	1705A.4.1.1 TMS 602 Section 1.6 Quality Assurance.
	
	
	
	Add amendment to modify footnote “d” from reference standard language.
	

	8-20
	1705A.5.1
	
	
	
	Revised references.
	

	8-21
	Table 1705A.5.3
	
	
	
	Provide pointer reference.
	

	8-22
	1705A.5.5
	
	
	
	Editorial change. Update reference pointer.
	

	8-23
	1705A.6 Soils.
	
	
	
	Proposing additional exceptions.
	

	8-24
	1705A.12.2 Cold-formed steel …
	
	
	
	Providing new reference pointer.
	

	8-25
	1705A.13.1.1 and 1705A.13.1.2
	
	
	
	Proposed amendment to align with proposed modifications and requirements in Section 1705A.2.1
	

	8-26
	1705A.13.3 Cold-formed steel …
	
	
	
	Providing new reference pointer.
	

	8-27
	1705A.13.5.2
	
	
	
	Correcting reference pointer.
	

	
	1705A.14.1.1 and 1705A.14.1.2
	
	
	
	Proposed amendment to align with proposed modifications and requirements in Section 1705A.2.1
	

	
	1705A.14.2 Nonstructural Components.
	
	
	
	Propose deleting references. Revise to include nationally recognized standards
	



ITEM 9
Chapter 18A, SOILS AND FOUNDATION
Adopt Chapter 18 of 2024 IBC as Chapter 18A of 2025 CBC and bring forward existing California amendments from the 2022 CBC with modification to sections listed below.
	DSA-SS 05-24
ITEM 9
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	9-1
	1803A.6 Geohazard reports.
	
	
	
	Propose two editorial changes and one substantive change to the continued amendment of this section. 
	

	9-2
	1807A.2 Retaining walls.
1807A.2.5 Freestanding cantilever walls.
	
	
	
	Repeal reference pointer. Repeal Section 1807A.2.5
	

	9-3
	1807A.3 Embedded posts and poles.
	
	
	
	Proposed clarifying amendment.
	

	9-4
	1809A.1 General.
	
	
	
	Proposed editorial change.
	

	9-5
	1809A.1415 Pipes and trenches.
	
	
	
	Previous amendment is continued but renumbered.
	

	9-6
	1809A.15 Grade beams.
	
	
	
	Proposed repeal of amendment.
	

	9-7
	1810A.3.3.1.2 Load tests.
	
	
	
	Proposed repeal of amendment. 
	

	9-8
	1810A.3.3.1.5
	
	
	
	Proposed repeal of amendment. 
	

	9-9
	1810A.3.3.2 Allowable lateral load.
	
	
	
	Proposed repeal of amendment. 
	

	9-10
	1810A.3.11.2
	
	
	
	New amendment.
	

	9-11
	1810A.3.12 Grade beams.
	
	
	
	Proposed repeal of amendment
	

	9-12
	1811A.4 Structural Requirements.
	
	
	
	Editorial Change.
	

	9-13
	1812A.2 Duration.
	
	
	
	Revise amendment to coordinate with AWPA U1.
	

	9-14
	1812A.5 Construction.
	
	
	
	Revise amendment.
	



ITEM 10
Chapter 19, CONCRETE
Adopt Chapter 19 of 2024 IBC and bring forward existing California amendments from the 2022 CBC with modification to sections listed below.
	DSA-SS 05-24
ITEM 10
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	10-1
	1901.1.2
	
	
	
	Editorial change in language for clarity.
	

	10-2
	1901.1.3 Identification of amendments.
	
	
	
	Added section to clarify identification of amendments and adopting agency.
	

	10-3
	1901.1.4 1901.1.3
	
	
	
	Renumbered section due to added section above.
	

	10-4
	1901.1.5 1901.1.4 Additional amendments. Amendments.
	
	
	
	Renumbered section due to added section above with minor clarifying language.
	

	10-5
	1909.2.1 Aggregates.
	
	
	
	Repeal amendment. 
	

	10-6
	1909.2.76 Proof Ttests for post-installed anchors in concrete.
	
	
	
	Revise amendment language in this section and all the subsections.
	

	10-7
	1909.3.9 ACI 318, Section 26.11.1.2.
	
	
	
	Relocate existing amendment and carry forward.
	

	10-8
	1909.3.910 ACI 318, Section 26.12.2.1(a)
	
	
	
	Renumbering and editorial revisions.
	

	10-9
	1909.4 Shotcrete.
1909.4.1, 1909.4.2, and 1909.4.3
	
	
	
	Proposes one substantive change and two organizational changes.
	




ITEM 11
Chapter 19A, CONCRETE
Adopt Chapter 19 of 2024 IBC as Chapter 19A of 2025 CBC and bring forward existing California amendments from the 2022 CBC with modification to sections listed below.
	DSA-SS 05-24
ITEM 11
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	11-1
	1901.2.1 Structural concrete with GFRP reinforcement.
	
	
	
	Repeal model code language.
	

	11-2
	1901A.5 Construction documents.
	
	
	
	Repeal model code language.
	

	11-3
	1903A.2 Special inspections.
	
	
	
	Repeal model code language.
	

	11-4
	1903A.3
	
	
	
	Existing amendment moved with relocated model.
	

	11-5
	1903A.5 Aggregates 
	
	
	
	Propose repealing the amendment.
	

	11-6
	1903A.4 1903A.7
1903A.5 1903A.8
	
	
	
	Renumber existing amendments.
	

	11-7
	1905A.2 ACI 318 Section 2.3.
	
	
	
	Continued deletion of the definitions.
	

	11-8
	1905A.3.1 Connections designed to yield.
	
	
	
	Existing amendment moved with relocated model.
	

	11-9
	1905A.5 and 1905A.6 with subsections
	
	
	
	Continued deletion of provisions from model code.
	

	11-10
	1905A.7 Design requirements for anchors, 1905A.7.1, and 1905A.7.2
	
	
	
	Propose one substantive change and minor editorial changes to these sections.
	

	11-11
	1906A Reserved
	
	
	
	Marked “RESERVED”.
	

	11-12
	1906A.1 Plain concrete footings.
	
	
	
	Continued deletion of the model..
	

	11-13
	1908A.1 General.
1908A.2, and 1908A.3
	
	
	
	One substantive change and two organizational changes to these sections.
	

	11-14
	1909A.1 1905A.1.1 through 1909A.9 1905A.1.11
	
	
	
	Existing amendments are continued but relocated.
	

	11-15
	1909A.10 1905A.1.12 ACI 318, Section 19.2.1.1 and Table 19.2.1.1.
	
	
	
	Existing amendments are continued but relocated with modifications.
	

	11-16
	1909A.11 1905A.1.13 through 1909A.16 1905A.1.17
	
	
	
	Existing amendments are continued but relocated.
	

	11-17
	1910A.5 Proof Ttests for post-installed anchors in concrete.
	
	
	
	Proposed changes to the testing requirements of post-installed anchors.
	

	11-18
	1910A.5.1 General.
	
	
	
	Proposed changes to the general testing requirements of post-installed anchors.
	

	11-19
	1910A.5.2 Proof Ttesting procedure.
	
	
	
	Proposed changes to the testing procedure of post-installed anchors.
	

	11-20
	1910A.5.3 Test frequency., 1910A.5.3.1 and 1910A.5.3.2
	
	
	
	Proposed changes to the testing frequency of post-installed anchors.
	

	11-21
	1910A.5.5 Test acceptance criteria.
	
	
	
	Proposed changes to the testing criteria of post-installed anchors.
	

	11-22
	1911A.2 Crack repair by epoxy injection.
	
	
	
	Proposed changes to amendment. Also, adopt ACI 548.15 specification.
	



ITEM 12
Chapter 20, ALUMINUM
Adopt Chapter 20 of 2024 IBC and bring forward existing California amendments from the 2022 CBC with modification to sections listed below.
	DSA-SS 05-24
ITEM 12
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	12-1
	2001.1.2 Amendments in this chapter.
	
	
	
	Editorial change in language for clarity.
	



ITEM 13
Chapter 21, MASONRY
Adopt Chapter 21 of 2024 IBC and bring forward existing California amendments from the 2022 CBC with modification to sections listed below.
	DSA-SS 05-24
ITEM 13
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	13-1
	[bookmark: _Hlk165273473]2101.1.2
	
	
	
	Editorial change in language for clarity.
	

	13-2
	2101.1.3 Identification of amendments.
	
	
	
	Added section to clarify identification of amendments and adopting agency.
	

	13-3
	2101.1.4 2101.1.3
	
	
	
	Renumbered section due to added section above.
	

	13-4
	2101.1.5 2101.1.4 Additional amendments. Amendments.
	
	
	
	Renumbered section due to added section above with minor clarifying language.
	

	13-5
	2115.1.1 Prohibitions.
	
	
	
	Editorial updates to the list of prohibitions to align with TMS.
	

	13-6
	2115.2 Masonry construction materials.
	
	
	
	Sections are reorganized to align with current Chapter 21 sections and titles.
	

	13-7
	2115.2.1 2115.2
	
	
	
	Renumbered section and updated code reference.
	

	13-8
	2115.2.2 2115.3
	
	
	
	Renumbered section.
	

	13-9
	2115.2.3 Specified compressive strength of masonry and grout.
	
	
	
	Existing strength limit relocated into this section and format aligned with TMS 402 Table 4.3.1.
	

	13-10
	2115.3 Construction.
	
	
	
	Sections and subsections are reorganized to align with current Chapter 21 sections and titles.
	

	13-11
	2115.3.1 2115.4
2115.3.2 2115.5
2115.3.2.1 2115.5.1
	
	
	
	Renumbered section due to organizational change for amendments. Continued amendment relocated from other sections.
	

	13-12
	2115.3.2.2 2115.5.2
	
	
	
	Renumbered section due to organizational change. Relocated from 2115.5.2 with minor edits.
	

	13-13
	2115.3.2.3 2115.5.3
2115.3.2.4 2115.5.4
	
	
	
	Renumbered section due to organizational change.
	

	13-14
	2115.5.6 TMS 602, Article 3.5 E Consolidation.
	
	
	
	Repeal amendment.
	

	13-15
	2115.3.2.5 2115.5.7
	
	
	
	Renumbered section with other minor edits.
	

	13-16
	2115.3.2.6 2115.6
	
	
	
	Renumbered section with other minor edits.
	

	13-17
	2115.3.2.7 Reinforced hollow-unit masonry.
	
	
	
	New section to correspond to CBC chapter 21 section titles.
	

	13-18
	2115.3.2.7.1 2115.5.5
	
	
	
	Relocated amendment from existing Section 2115.5.5.
	

	13-19
	2115.4 Quality assurance.
	
	
	
	New section to correspond to CBC chapter 21 section titles.
	

	13-20
	2115.7 Compressive strength f′m.
	
	
	
	Existing amendment repealed.
	

	
	2115.8 Additional testing requirements.
	
	
	
	Delete current section due to reorganization.
	

	13-21
	2115.4.1 2115.8.1
	
	
	
	Renumbered section with additional modifications.
	

	13-22
	2115.4.2 2115.8.2
	
	
	
	Renumbered section with additional modifications.
	

	13-23
	2115.9 Modifications to TMS 402.
	
	
	
	Delete current section due to reorganization.
	

	13-24
	2115.5 Seismic Design.
	
	
	
	New section to correspond to CBC chapter 21 section titles.
	

	13-25
	2115.5.1 2115.9.1
	
	
	
	Renumbered section with additional changes.
	

	13-26
	2115.5.2 TMS 402, Section 7.3.2.5 (i).
	
	
	
	New section added.
	

	13-27
	2115.5.3 2115.9.2
	
	
	
	Renumbered section with minor editorial changes.
	

	13-28
	2115.6 2115.10 Additional requirements for allowable Allowable stress design.
	
	
	
	Editorial change to coordinate section.
	

	13-29
	2115.6.1 2115.10.1
	
	
	
	Renumbered section following organizational change.
	

	13-30
	2115.7 2115.11
	
	
	
	Renumbered amendment. Relocate existing Table 8.3.3.4 to Section 2115.6.1.
	



ITEM 14
Chapter 21A, MASONRY
Adopt Chapter 21 of 2024 IBC as Chapter 21A of 2025 CBC and bring forward existing California amendments from the 2022 CBC with modification to sections listed below.
	DSA-SS 05-24
ITEM 14
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	14-1
	2101A.1.3 Prohibition:
	
	
	
	Editorial change in language for clarity.
	

	14-2
	2103A.3.1 Aggregate.
	
	
	
	Previous amendment is continued.
	

	14-3
	2103A.6 Specified compressive strength of masonry and grout.
	
	
	
	New section with consolidated three sections into one.
	

	14-4
	2104A.1.3.1
	
	
	
	Addition of DSA-SS banner.
	

	14-5
	2104A.1.3.3 TMS 602, Article 3.4 B Reinforcement.
	
	
	
	Section is revised to align with TMS 602 and statutory mandate for use of plain language.
	

	14-6
	2104A.1.3.4 TMS 602, Article 3.4 D 3.4 E Anchor bolts.
	
	
	
	Revised section numbers to match revisions in other section.
	

	14-7
	2104A.1.3.5 [DSA-SS] TMS 602, Article 3.5 C Grout pour height.
	
	
	
	Eliminate requirement for grout aid which was not part of the reference standard. Amendments elsewhere in this chapter have been incorporated into the TMS 602 Table 7 for clarity.
	

	14-8
	2104A.1.3.6
	
	
	
	Existing amendment is retained with clarification.
	

	14-9
	2104A.1.3.7 Reserved TMS 602, Article 3.5 E Consolidation.
	
	
	
	Repeal redundant amendment. Mark as Reserved.
	

	14-10
	2104A.1.3.8
	
	
	
	Clarification.
	

	14-11
	2104A.1.3.9 TMS 602, Article 3.5 Grout placement.
	
	
	
	Updated to align with TMS imperative language and renumbering.
	

	14-12
	2104A.1.3.10.2 TMS 402, Section 5.1.3.2 Composite Action.
	
	
	
	Existing amendment is revised to align text with TMS 402; no material change intended.
	

	14-13
	2104A.1.3.10.3
	
	
	
	Update to match TMS renumbering.
	

	14-14
	2104A.1.3.10.4
	
	
	
	Update to SI units and renumbering.
	

	14-15
	2104A.1.3.10.5
	
	
	
	Continued amendment with editorial changes.
	

	14-16
	2104A.1.3.10.6
	
	
	
	Existing amendment repealed.
	

	14-17
	2104A.1.3.11.1
	
	
	
	Editorial revisions.
	

	14-18
	2104A.1.3.11.2
	
	
	
	Revised to align with re-organization.
	

	14-19
	2105A.2 Compressive strength
	
	
	
	Repeal amendment language.
	

	14-20
	2105A.3 Mortar and grout tests.
	
	
	
	Continued amendment with modifications.
	

	14-21
	[bookmark: _Hlk164346828]2105A.4 Masonry Core Testing.
	
	
	
	Existing amendment is retained with added language.
	

	14-22
	2106A.1.1 TMS 402, Sections 5.3.1.4(a) and 5.3.1.4(b) Section 5.4.1.4.
	
	
	
	Section is revised to align closely with changes.
	

	14-23
	2106A.1.2 TMS 402, Chapter 5.
	
	
	
	Revised reference section numbers.
	

	14-24
	2106A.1.3 TMS 402, Section 7.3.2.5 (i)
	
	
	
	New section with revisions to TMS 402.
	

	14-25
	2106A.1.4 2106A.1.3
	
	
	
	Renumber with minor editorial changes.
	

	14-26
	2107A.1 General.
	
	
	
	Updated reference pointer due to deleted sections.
	

	14-27
	2107A.6 Masonry Compressive Strength and 2108A.4
	
	
	
	Deleted sections which are no longer necessary.
	



ITEM 15
Chapter 22, STEEL
Adopt Chapter 22 of 2024 IBC and bring forward existing California amendments from the 2022 CBC with modification to sections listed below.
	DSA-SS 05-24
ITEM 15
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	15-1
	2201.1.2
	
	
	
	Editorial change in language for clarity.
	

	15-2
	2201.1.3 Identification of amendments.
	
	
	
	Added section to clarify identification of amendments and adopting agency.
	

	15-3
	2201.1.4 2201.1.3
	
	
	
	Renumbered section due to added section above.
	

	15-4
	2201.1.5 2201.1.4 Additional amendments. Amendments.
	
	
	
	Renumbered section due to added section above with minor clarifying language.
	

	15-5
	2215.1 2212.1 General. Connections.
	
	
	
	Editorial change to coordinate section titles for amendments to correspond to CBC chapter 22 section titles.
	

	15-6
	2215.1.1 2212.1.1
	
	
	
	Renumbered and revised amendment.
	

	15-7
	2215.2 2212.2 Modifications to AISC 341. 
2215.2.1 2212.2.1
	
	
	
	Renumbered and revised amendments.
	

	15-8
	2215.2.2 2212.2.2
	
	
	
	Renumbered.
	

	15-9
	2215.3 2212.3
	
	
	
	Renumbered and pointer revised.
	

	15-10
	2215.4 2212.5, 2215.5 2212.4, 2215.6 2212.6, 2215.6.1 2212.6.1 and 2215.6.2 2212.6.2
	
	
	
	Existing amendments are retained. Renumbered sections due to reorganization of Chapter 22.
	



ITEM 16
Chapter 22A, STEEL
Adopt Chapter 22 of 2024 IBC as Chapter 22A of 2025 CBC and bring forward existing California amendments from the 2022 CBC with modification to sections listed below.
	DSA-SS 05-24
ITEM 16
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	16-1
	2201A.2 Identification.
	
	
	
	Adding reference to Chapter 17A.
	

	16-2
	2201A.5.1 2204A.4 Shear transfer at column Column base plate.
	
	
	
	Existing Section 2204A.4 relocated to this section to align with reorganized Chapter 22A and amended.
	

	16-3
	2202A.2.1 Structural steel seismic force-resisting systems and composite structural steel …
	
	
	
	Existing exceptions to Section 2205A.1 are relocated to new Section 2202A.1 to align with reorganized Chapter 22A.
	

	16-4
	2202A.2.1.1
	
	
	
	Existing amendment moved from Section 2205A.2.1.1.
	

	16-5
	[bookmark: _Hlk162964957]2202A.2.1.2
	
	
	
	Amendment in existing Section 2205A.2.1.2 is retained.
	

	16-6
	2202A.2.2 Structural steel elements.
	
	
	
	Reference to Seismic Design Categories B and C are deleted.
	

	16-7
	2202A.5 2205A.3 Modifications to AISC 341.
	
	
	
	Renumbered section due to organizational change.
	

	16-8
	2202A.5.1 2205A.3.1
2202A.5.2 2205A.3.2
	
	
	
	Renumbering.
	

	16-9
	2202A.6 Modifications to AISC 358.
	
	
	
	New added to incorporate modifications to AISC 358.
	

	16-10
	2202A.6.1 Modifications to AISC 358 Chapter 10. 
2206A.2.1
	
	
	
	Existing amendment in exception to Section 2206A.2.1 is relocated to this section.
	

	16-11
	2204A.1 General.
	
	
	
	Amendments deleted. 
	

	16-12
	2204.2 Seismic design.
2204.2.1, 2204.2.2
	
	
	
	Model code sections are deleted.
	

	16-13
	2206A.1.1.1, 2206A.1.1.2, 2206A.1.2, 2206A.1.3
	
	
	
	Amendments in existing sections are carried forward and relocated/aligned with new reorganization of Chapter 22A.
	

	16-14
	2206A.1.3.1 Truss design drawings.
	
	
	
	Existing amendment is carried forward. Added reference to AISI S202.
	

	16-15
	2206A.2 Nonstructural members.
	
	
	
	Existing amendment carried forward.
	

	16-16
	2208A.1 Steel decks. 2210A.1.1.2
	
	
	
	Existing amendments carried forward from 2210A.1.1.2.
	

	16-17
	2214A.1 General.
	
	
	
	Existing amendments carried forward from 2208A.1.
	

	16-18
	2215A 2212A
2215A.1 2212A.1 General.
	
	
	
	All subsections within this section are renumbered.
	

	16-19
	2215A.1.1 2212A.1.1 Configuration.
	
	
	
	Renumbered and pointers revised.
	

	16-20
	2215A.1.2 2212A.1.2
2215A.2 2212A.2
	
	
	
	Renumbered sections.
	

	16-21
	2215A.2.1 2212A.2.1 Base materials.
	
	
	
	Renumbered. New amendment is added.
	

	
	2215A.2.2 2212A.2.2
2215A.2.3 2212A.2.3
2215A.2.4 2212A.2.4
2215A.2.5 2212A.2.5
	
	
	
	Existing amendments renumbered.
	

	16-22
	2216A 2213A
	
	
	
	Renumbered.
	

	16-23
	2216A.1 2213A.1
	
	
	
	Renumbered and pointer revised.
	

	16-24
	2216A.2 2213A.2 Tests of end-welded studs.
	
	
	
	Renumbered. Reference revised to align with new version of AWS D1.1. Exemption for fillet welded studs added to the AWS D1.1 is incorporated.
	


ITEM 17
Chapter 23, WOOD
Adopt Chapter 23 of 2024 IBC and bring forward existing California amendments from the 2022 CBC with modification to sections listed below.
	DSA-SS 05-24
ITEM 17
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	17-1
	2301.1.2
	
	
	
	Editorial change in language for clarity.
	

	17-2
	2301.1.3 Identification of amendments.
	
	
	
	Added section to clarify identification of amendments and adopting agency.
	

	17-3
	2301.1.4 2301.1.3, 2301.1.4.1 2301.1.3.1 and 2301.1.4.2 2301.1.3.2
	
	
	
	Renumbered section due to added section above.
	

	17-4
	2301.1.5 2301.1.4 [DSA-SS & , DSA-SS/CC] Prohibition.
	
	
	
	Retain amendments. Repeal CLT prohibition in Item 10 since reference standard now includes this system. DSA banner is added to Item 9.
	

	17-5
	2303.1.4.1 Additional requirements.
	
	
	
	Editorial change in language for clarity.
	

	17-6
	2305.1.3 2305.1.2 Additional requirements.
	
	
	
	Renumbered section and reference pointer.
	

	17-7
	2308.2 Limitations.  
2308.2.8 2308.2.7
	
	
	
	Renumbered section and reference pointers.
	



ITEM 18
Chapter 24, GLASS AND GLAZING
Adopt Chapter 24 of 2024 IBC and bring forward existing California amendments from the 2022 CBC with modification to sections listed below.
	DSA-SS 05-24
ITEM 18
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	18-1
	2401.1.2
	
	
	
	Editorial change.
	

	18-2
	2410.1.3 Monitoring.
	
	
	
	Editorial change.
	



ITEM 19
Chapter 25, GYPSUM PANEL PRODUCTS AND PLASTER 
Adopt Chapter 25 of 2024 IBC and bring forward existing California amendments from the 2022 CBC with modification to sections listed below.
	DSA-SS 05-24
ITEM 19
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	19-1
	2501.1.2
	
	
	
	Editorial change.
	

	19-2
	2503.2 Additional requirements for inspection and testing.
	
	
	
	Editorial change.
	

	19-3
	2507.3 Lath attachment to horizontal wood supports.
	
	
	
	Proposes to add language to Item 2 in amendment.
	



ITEM 20
Chapter 26, PLASTIC
Adopt Chapter 26 of 2024 IBC and bring forward existing California amendments from the 2022 CBC with modification to sections listed below.
	DSA-SS 05-24
ITEM 20
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	20-1
	2601.1.1, 2601.1.2
	
	
	
	Amendments repealed.
	

	20-2
	2603.11.1, 2603.12.3, and 2603.13.3
	
	
	
	Model code language for these sections is being relocated to Chapter 14, but DSA is repealing amendments for those sections.
	



ITEM 21
Chapter 30, ELEVATORS AND CONVEYING SYSTEMS
Adopt Chapter 30 of 2024 IBC without amendment.
	DSA-SS 05-24
ITEM 21
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	21-1
	Chapter 30
	
	
	
	Adopt Chapter 30 of 2024 IBC without amendment.
	



ITEM 22
Chapter 31, SPECIAL CONSTRUCTION
Adopt Chapter 31 of 2024 IBC and bring forward existing California amendments from the 2022 CBC with modification to sections listed below.
	DSA-SS 05-24
ITEM 22
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	22-1
	3103.1 General.
	
	
	
	New amendment language.
	

	22-2
	3111.1.1 Wind resistance.
	
	
	
	Revise pointer.
	

	22-3
	3114 3114
	
	
	
	All subsections renumbered.
	

	22-4
	3114.1 Exceptions:
3114.6 Roof Assemblies.
	
	
	
	Existing amendments in renumbered sections are carried forward.
	

	22-5
	3114.8.2 Welds.
	
	
	
	Repeal existing amendment.
	

	22-6
	3114.8.4.1 Material properties.
	
	
	
	Repeal existing amendments.
	

	22-7
	3114.8.4.2 Seismic design parameters.
	
	
	
	Existing amendment in renumbered section is repealed. Amendment in Item 1 is carried forward.
	

	22-8
	3114.8.5
	
	
	
	Existing amendment is carried forward.
	

	22-9
	3114.9 3115.9
3114.9.1 3115.9.1 
3114.9.2 3115.9.2
3114.9.3 3115.9.3
	
	
	
	Existing amendments in Section 3115.9 and sub-sections are carried forward and renumbered.
	



ITEM 23
Chapters 31D, 32 and 33
Adopt Chapter 31D for DSA-SS and DSA-SS/CC. Adopt Chapters 32 and 33 of 2024 IBC without amendment.
	DSA-SS 05-24
ITEM 23
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	23-1
	Chapter 31D
	
	
	
	Adopt Chapter 31D for DSA-SS and DSA-SS/CC.
	

	23-2
	Chapters 32 and 33
	
	
	
	Adopt chapters 32-33 of 2024 IBC without amendment.
	



ITEM 24
Chapter 35, REFERENCED STANDARDS
Adopt Chapter 35 of 2024 IBC and bring forward existing California amendments from the 2022 CBC with modification to sections listed below.
	DSA-SS 05-24
ITEM 24
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	24-1
	AAMA/WDCA/CSA101/I.S.2/A440-22:
ACI 318-19
	
	
	
	Referenced sections revised.
	

	24-2
	ACI 355.2—22 19
ACI 355.4—19 (21)
ACI 440.2R-08 17
	
	
	
	Updating reference standards editions.
	

	24-3
	ACI 503.7—07
ACI 548.15-20
	
	
	
	Amendment is repealed and replaced by ACI 548.15.
	

	24-4
	ACI 506.2-13 (18)
ACI 506.4R –19
ACI 506.6T—17
	
	
	
	Adding new reference standards.
	

	24-5
	ANSI/AISC 341—22
ANSI/AISC 358—22
ANSI/AISC 360—22
ANSI/AISC 370—21
	
	
	
	Referenced sections revised.
	

	24-6
	AISI S100—16(2020) w/S2—20
AISI S240—20
AISI S400—20
	
	
	
	Referenced sections revised.
	

	24-7
	ASCE/SEI 7-22

	
	
	
	Adopting Supplement 1. 
	

	24-8
	ASCE/SEI 41-23
	
	
	
	Adding this reference standard to the code.
	

	24-9
	ASHRAE 171-2017
	
	
	
	Adding this reference standard to the code.
	

	24-10
	ASTM A615/A615M – 20 22
ASTM A706/A706M- 2016 22a
ASTM A1064 - 17 22
ASTM C618 -19 23e1
ASTM C635/C635M – 2017 22
ASTM C989 – 22 18a
ASTM C1019 – 16 20
ASTM C1249—18 (2023)
ASTM C1401 –14 23
ASTM D1586 – 20 18e1
ASTM D3966 – 07(2013) 22
ASTM E580/E580M –17 22
ASTM C1586 - 05(2011) 20
	
	
	
	Updating reference standards editions and revising referenced sections.
	

	24-11
	ASTM A722/A722M - 2018 
ASTM C150/C150M—21
ASTM C270—19ae1
ASTM C595/C595M—21
ASTM C636/C636M-19
ASTM C1157/C1157M—20a
	
	
	
	Referenced sections revised.
	

	24-12
	ASTM C482 – 20
ASTM C636/C636M—17
	
	
	
	Repeal referenced standards.
	

	24-13
	ASTM C1714/C1714M-23
ASTM C1823/C1823M – 20
ASTM E3121 – 17
	
	
	
	Added reference standards.
	

	24-14
	ANSI/AWC NDS—2024
	
	
	
	Revised year for supplement.
	

	24-15
	AWS B5.1 – 2013-AMD1
AWS D1.6D1.6M – 2017
	
	
	
	Added reference standards.
	

	24-16
	AWS D1.1/D1.1M – 15 20
AWS D1.3/D1.3M –08 2018
AWS D1.8/D1.8M –2016 2021
	
	
	
	Updated reference standards editions.
	

	24-17
	AWS D1.4/D1.4M—2018
AWS QC1 – 2016
	
	
	
	Referenced sections revised.
	

	24-18
	FM 1950 –2016 2022
	
	
	
	Updated reference standards editions.
	

	24-19
	ICC 300—2017 23
ICC-ES AC 01 –21 24
ICC-ES AC 58 –21 24
ICC-ES AC 70 –21 24
ICC-ES AC 106 –21 24
ICC-ES AC 125 –21 24
ICC-ES AC 156 –21 24
ICC-ES AC 178 –21 24
ICC-ES AC 193 –21 24
ICC-ES AC 232 –21 24
ICC-ES AC 308 –21 24
ICC-ES AC 358 –21 24
[bookmark: _Hlk154056438]ICC-ES AC 446 –21 24
	
	
	
	Updated reference standards editions and revised referenced sections.
	

	24-20
	PCI MNL-120—17
	
	
	
	Referenced sections revised.
	

	24-21
	TMS 402—2022
TMS 602—2022
	
	
	
	Referenced sections revised.
	



BSC TP-123 (Rev. 2/24) Commission Action Matrix	June 26, 2024
DSA-SS 05/24 - Part 2 - 2024 Triennial Code Cycle	CAM - Initial
Division of the State Architect	Page 1 of 1
